

**IN-PLACE BID RESULTS
NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP MAY 8, 2017**

The meeting was called to order at 9:02 AM. In attendance were Manager Jeff Bartlett, Public Works Director Garry Remaley and Secretary Brenda Norder. The purpose of the meeting was to open bids for in-place road jobs for the year 2017. As advertised, bids for the following items were opened:

MICROSURFACING	Asphalt Maint	Asphalt Paving	Midland
Type A Double Application 47,139 sq yds +/-	No Bid	3.45 162,629.55	No Bid
Crack Seal 500 gals +/-		19.29 9,645.00	
4" Single white edge line 18,700 lf +/- * see attchmt 1-C		.55 10,285.00	
4" Double yellow center line 9,350 lf +/- * see attchmt 1-C		1.10 10,285.00	
TOTAL		192,844.55	

ULTRA THIN BONDED WEARING COURSE	Asphalt Maint	Asphalt Paving	Midland
Ultra-Thin Bonded Wearing Course 31,773 sq yds +/-	5.89 187,142.94	No Bid	5.53 175,704.69
Crack seal 500 gals +/-	15.74 7,870.00		18.655 9,327.50
TOTAL	195,012.97		185,032.19

BITUMINOUS SEAL COAT	Asphalt Maint	Asphalt Paving	Midland
Single Application #8 stone 58,940 sq yds +/-	1.71 100,787.40	No Bid	No Bid
Crack seal 700 gals +/-	15.74 11,018.00		
Single Application Type 1 Slurry Seal Coat #8 stone 19,914 sq yds +/-	4.21 83,837.94		
TOTAL	195,643.34		

CRACK SEAL	Asphalt Maint	Asphalt Paving	Midland
Rubberized Joint Crack Seal 1,400 sq yds +/-	15.74 22,036.00	No Bid	18.50 25,900.00
TOTAL	22,036.00		25,900.00

The Manager will review the bids for administrative completeness. Awarding of the bids, pending the review, is scheduled for a later date. Meeting adjourned at 9:08 AM.

Respectfully submitted,

Brenda Norder, Secretary/Treasurer